(BID RESULTS HAVE NOT BEEN FULLY EVALUATED)

BID TABULATION - JUNE 9, 2022
SOUTH BROWARD DRAINAGE DISTRICT REBID OF POST DISASTER VAC TRUCK/DREDGER SERVICES

COMPANY NAMES s HINTERLAND GROUP, INC. ENVIROWASTE Services Group Inc. DP DEVELOPMENT
REGULAR REGULAR REGULAR
EQUIPMENT CAPACITY/SIZE O.T./HR. CAPACITY/SIZE O.T./HR. CAPACITY/SIZE O.T./HR.
EQUIPMENT TIME/HR. P TIME/HR. — TIME/HR. e —
VAC TRUCK W/EXPERIENCED
OPERATOR & ({REW 3500 Gal 350.00 450.00 Vactor 2100 12-15 CY $249.00 $324.00 Vactor 2115-18PD 15CY/ 425hp 376.00 498.00
DREDGE BOAT W/EXPERIENCED
/ No Bid No Bid No Bid
OPERATOR & CREW
PORTABLE DREDGE W/EXPERIENCED
/ No Bid No Bid No Bid
OPERATOR & CREW
TRACK HOE CAT 325 $250.00 $325.00 No Bid John Deere 470G (#113k) $365.00 $436.00
BACKHOE LOADER CAT 928 $250.00 $325.00 See Attached $249.00 $324.00 Caterpillar 420 E o.e. $160.00 $224.00
ADDITIONAL EMPLOYEES:
SUPERVISOR 120.00 150.00 90.00 120.00 143.00 190.00
LABORER $85.00 $100.00 $65.00 $90.00 $57.00 $114.00
CATEGORY FIELD NAME & DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT PRICE FIELD NAME & DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT PRICE FIELD NAME & DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT PRICE
0-5 Miles Remove and Collect 0-5 Miles Remove and Collect 0-5 Miles Remove and Collect
Material & Sand Collect and Haul material/sand/debris from Drainage ?ulverts cy 65.00 material/sand/debris from Drainage ?u/verts cy 300.00 material/sand/debris from Drainage C.u/verts cy 192.00
and Structures and Transport to Debris and Structures and Transport to Debris and Structures and Transport to Debris
Management Site ( DMS ). Management Site ( DMS ). Management Site ( DMS ).
6-15 Miles Remove and Collect 6-15 Miles Remove and Collect 6-15 Miles Remove and Collect
material/sand/debris from Drainage Culverts cy $80.00 material/sand/debris from Drainage Culverts cy $350.00 material/sand/debris from Drainage Culverts cy $254.00
and Structures and Transport to DMS. and Structures and Transport to DMS. and Structures and Transport to DMS.
16-30 Miles Remove and Collect 16-30 Miles Remove and Collect 16-30 Miles Remove and Collect
material/sand/debris from Drainage Culverts cy $110.00 material/sand/debris from Drainage Culverts cy $375.00 material/sand/debris from Drainage Culverts cy $317.00
and Structures and Transport to DMS. and Structures and Transport to DMS. and Structures and Transport to DMS.
31-60 Miles Remove and Collect 31-60 Miles Remove and Collect 31-60 Miles Remove and Collect
material/sand/debris from Drainage Culverts cy $200.00 material/sand/debris from Drainage Culverts cy $400.00 material/sand/debris from Drainage Culverts cy $484.00
and Structures and Transport to DMS. and Structures and Transport to DMS. and Structures and Transport to DMS.
Single Price Remove material/sand/debris Single Price Remove material/sand/debris Single Price Remove material/sand/debris
[from Drainage Culverts and Structures and N from Drainage Culverts and Structures and oy 500.00 from Drainage Culverts and Structures and oy 610.00
Transport to DMS. Removal for any haul Transport to DMS. Removal for any haul Transport to DMS. Removal for any haul
distance. distance. distance.
Remove material/sand/debris from an 18” Remove material/sand/debris from an 18” Remove material/sand/debris from an 18”
Material & Sand Removal Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the LF $15.00 Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the LF $15.00 Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the LF $59.00
adjacent water body. adjacent water body. adjacent water body.
Remove material/sand/debris from a 24” Remove material/sand/debris from a 24” Remove material/sand/debris from a 24”
Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the LF $20.00 Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the LF $20.00 Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the LF $67.00
adjacent water body. adjacent water body. adjacent water body.
Remove material/sand/debris from a 30” Remove material/sand/debris from a 30” Remove material/sand/debris from a 30”
Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the LF $20.00 Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the LF $25.00 Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the LF $§75.00
adjacent water body. adjacent water body. adjacent water body.
Remove material/sand/debris from a 36” Remove material/sand/debris from a 36” Remove material/sand/debris from a 36”
Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the LF $20.00 Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the LF $30.00 Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the LF $106.00

adjacent water body.

adjacent water body.

adjacent water body.
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Remove material/sand/debris from a 48” Remove material/sand/debris from a 48” Remove material/sand/debris from a 48”
Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the LF $30.00 Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the LF $40.00 Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the LF $155.00
adjacent water body. adjacent water body. adjacent water body.
Remove material/sand/debris from a 54” Remove material/sand/debris from a 54” Remove material/sand/debris from a 54”
Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the LF $30.00 Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the LF $55.00 Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the LF $189.00
adjacent water body. adjacent water body. adjacent water body.
Remove material/sand/debris from a 60” Remove material/sand/debris from a 60” Remove material/sand/debris from a 60”
Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the LF $40.00 Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the LF $80.00 Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the LF $276.00
adjacent water body. adjacent water body. adjacent water body.
Remove material/sand/debris from a 72” Remove material/sand/debris from a 72” Remove material/sand/debris from a 72”
Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the LF $45.00 Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the LF $100.00 Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the LF $324.00
adjacent water body. adjacent water body. adjacent water body.
Remove material/sand/debris from an 84” Remove material/sand/debris from an 84” Remove material/sand/debris from an 84”
Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the LF $50.00 Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the LF $130.00 Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the LF $828.00
adjacent water body. adjacent water body. adjacent water body.
Remove material/sand/debris from a 96” Remove material/sand/debris from a 96” Remove material/sand/debris from a 96”
Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the LF $60.00 Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the LF $150.00 Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the LF $927.00
adjacent water body. adjacent water body. adjacent water body.
0-5 Miles from DMS to Final Disposal. 0-5 Miles from DMS to Final Disposal. 0-5 Miles from DMS to Final Disposal.

Final Disposal Transport processed material/sand/debris cY $65.00 Transport processed material/sand/debris cYy $300.00 Transport processed material/sand/debris cY $218.00
rom DMS to final disposal 0-5 Miles. rom DMS to final disposal 0-5 Miles. rom DMS to final disposal 0-5 Miles.
6-15 Miles from DMS to Final Disposal. 6-15 Miles from DMS to Final Disposal. 6-15 Miles from DMS to Final Disposal.
Transport processed material/sand/debris cY $75.00 Transport processed material/sand/debris cYy $350.00 Transport processed material/sand/debris cY $227.00
rom DMS to final disposal 6-15 Miles. rom DMS to final disposal 6-15 Miles. rom DMS to final disposal 6-15 Miles.
16-30 Miles from DMS to Final Disposal. 16-30 Miles from DMS to Final Disposal. 16-30 Miles from DMS to Final Disposal.
Transport processed material/sand/debris cYy $125.00 Transport processed material/sand/debris cYy $375.00 Transport processed material/sand/debris cY $242.00
rom DMS to final disposal 16-30 Miles. rom DMS to final disposal 16-30 Miles. rom DMS to final disposal 16-30 Miles.
60+ Miles from DMS to Final Disposal. 60+ Miles from DMS to Final Disposal. 60+ Miles from DMS to Final Disposal.
Transport processed material/sand/debris cYy $150.00 Transport processed material/sand/debris cYy $400.00 Transport processed material/sand/debris cYy $316.00
rom DMS to final disposal 60+ Miles. rom DMS to final disposal 60+ Miles. rom DMS to final disposal 60+ Miles.

Bonding Provide Performance and Payment Bond LS 3.00% Provide Performance and Payment Bond LS $5,000.00 Provide Performance and Payment Bond LS as/if required
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